
SPOTTING 
OPPORTUNITIES
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IDENTIFY, CREATE AND SEIZE 
OPPORTUNITIES

I can find opportunities to help others.
I can recognise opportunities to create 

value in my community and 
surroundings.

I can explain what makes an opportunity 
to create value.

I can explain what makes an opportunity 
to create value.

I can describe different analytical 
approaches to identify entrepreneurial 

opportunities.

I can use my knowledge and 
understanding of the context to make 

opportunities to create value.

I can judge opportunities for creating 
value and decide whether to follow these 

up at different levels of the system I am 
working in (for example, micro, meso or 

macro).

I can spot and quickly take advantage of 
an opportunity.

FOCUS ON CHALLENGES
I can find different examples of 
challenges that need solutions.

I can recognise challenges in my 
community and surroundings that I can 

contribute to solving.

I can identify opportunities to solve 
problems in alternative ways.

I can identify opportunities to solve 
problems in alternative ways.

I can take apart established practices and 
challenge mainstream thought to create 
opportunities and look at challenges in 

different ways.

I can judge the right time to take an 
opportunity to create value.

I can cluster different opportunities or 

identify synergies among different 
opportunities to make the most out of 

them.

I can define opportunities where I can 
maintain a competitive advantage.

UNCOVER NEEDS
I can find examples of groups who have 

benefited from a solution to a given 
problem.

I can identify needs in my community 
and surroundings that have not been 

met.

I can explain that different groups may 

have different needs.

I can explain that different groups may 

have different needs.

I can carry out a needs analysis involving 
relevant stakeholders.

I can identify challenges related to the 
contrasting needs and interests of 

different stakeholders.

I can produce a ‘roadmap’ which 
matches the needs with the actions 

needed to deal with them and helps me 
create value.

I can design projects which aim to 
anticipate future needs.

ANALYSE THE CONTEXT

I can tell the difference between different 
areas where value can be created (for 

example, at home, in the community, in 
the environment, or in the economy or 

society).

I can recognise the different roles the 
public, private and third sectors play in 

my region or country.

I can tell the difference between contexts 
for creating value (for example, 

communities and informal networks, 
existing organisations, the market).

I can identify my personal, social and 
professional opportunities for creating 
value, both in existing organisations or 

by setting up new ventures.

I can identify the boundaries of the 
system that are relevant to  my (or my 

team's) value-creating activity.

I can analyse an existing value-creation 
activity by looking at it as a whole and 
identifying opportunities to develop it 

further.

I can monitor relevant trends and see 
how they create threats and new 

opportunities to create value.

I can promote a culture within my 
organisation that is open to spotting the 
weak signals of change, leading to new 

opportunities for creating value.


